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There is a moment within every heart that is divinely blueprinted to 
awaken one's soul to its true inheritance as an undeniable expression 
of Source Love and Light.  Throughout history this kind of a spiritual 
awakening has most often taken place within individuals who were 
ready to bring their service into the world.  Even with an awakening, it 
would sometimes take years before that service might completely 
manifest. Yet now there is such a universal outpouring of Love and 
Light around your world that thousands of souls are awakening 
almost simultaneously. As this quantum awakening progresses, be 



prepared to be joyfully overwhelmed by how quickly you may all be 
crossing over the threshold into a new Golden Age.  

Masters Jeshua & Mary Magdalene, Kuthumi & Lady Claire: 
Due to the tremendous influx of Love and Light that has been pouring 
into the hearts of humanity over the last few months, many across your 
world are starting to remember how powerful, loving and wise they truly 
are and how they have the ability to make positive changes within 
themselves, within their relationships and within the world!  The shifts 
you want to see are now being supported by the angels and all of us on 
the spiritual planes more than ever. Yet keep in mind that we only give 
our energies to the creations that are founded in love. Other creations 
attract energy through vibrational resonance, so since you have free will, 
whatever you think is made manifest based on the depth of your intent. 
In these times, your thoughts and feelings are being amplified more than 
usual; therefore, it is a good idea to pay very close attention to what you 
are putting into motion.  
 
Source energies are continuing to stimulate the remembrance of Oneness 
within the ancient crystalline strands of your DNA. Although these 
strands are all blueprinted to be opened during the Great Shift in the 
Ages, they are like little microcosmic time capsules—each one is going 
to light up in its own time, and the actual moment is determined by your 
Presence and your soul's Divine Blueprint for these times. As these 
strands wake up, they may be stimulating very ancient, pre-separation 
memories of having lived in Oneness within other civilizations. These 
memories are important to humanity because they can be used to 
establish Unity Consciousness within these times.  
 
You are all creators who are literally dreaming your next evolutionary 
step into existence as surely as you dreamed your present world into 
being. It all begins inside of each of your hearts and minds and it is all 
happening now. It is your choice what your	
  new Golden Age is going to 
look like	
  and feel like as you walk within it. Yet one thing is certain—



you must be totally present to live in the freedom that you are being 
called into at this time.  
 
There is a pulsing glow of living Light that is becoming stronger within 
your planet. This increase has expanded humanity's access to the 
crystalline grid that is surrounding your Earth. That grid is being 
supported by each one of you who is aligned with the Source Love and 
Light at the core of your being. This crystalline, or All Christ grid, is 
supporting all the Love and Light that each of you has assimilated over 
the ages so your combined forces can spiritually lift the consciousness of 
your world into the 5th Dimension.  
 
The frequency changes within your bodies and within your world are a 
necessary part of this great shift. They are making the ascension into the 
5th dimension possible, and though you are truly multi-dimensional, a 
full ascension involves taking the whole of your emotional, physical and 
mental bodies into Unity Consciousness. This potential was amplified 
for many of you as you walked through the 11.11.11 portal. What you 
established within your world at that time is now part of a bridge into the 
5th dimension that will continue to be strengthened by each one of you 
as you continue to walk more fully as your Presence.  
 
Please know that you are truly being supported and applauded across all 
of the heavenly worlds for building this bridge. And as a result of your 
continued dedication, the ascension gates will continue to widen to 
include more and more of humanity. When you are truly present you 
are—in that very moment—an awakened being. If your mind wonders 
off into the memories of yesterday or the fantasies of tomorrow, then 
you have placed your attention back into the illusionary world of the ego 
and separated yourself from your Divine Presence. Though this is where 
the majority of humanity is still focusing its consciousness, you are 
being called to do whatever is necessary to live as your True Self so you 
can Walk the Earth as Living Master during these pivotal times and 
manifest your part in the new Golden Age.	
  
 



To learn more about the Golden Age Courses and Golden Age Teachers 
Trainings created by the Masters, go to: 
www.WalkTheEarthAsALivingMaster.com and click on the menu:  

*	
  Co-­‐Creating	
  a	
  New	
  Golden	
  Age	
  Course	
  (now	
  an	
  online	
  course)	
  
*	
  Golden	
  Age	
  Man	
  and	
  Woman	
  Course	
  	
  	
  (now	
  an	
  online	
  course)	
  
*	
  Golden	
  Age	
  Man	
  and	
  Woman	
  Teachers	
  Training	
  	
  (Feb.	
  18-­‐21,	
  2012 in	
  Maui)	
  	
  	
  	
  
*	
  Golden	
  Age	
  Children	
  Course	
  for	
  Parents	
  &	
  Teachers	
  	
  (now	
  an	
  online	
  course)	
  
*	
  Golden	
  Age	
  Children	
  Teachers	
  Training	
  	
  	
  (Spring	
  2012	
  in	
  Maui)	
  
*	
  Walk	
  the	
  Earth	
  as	
  a	
  Living	
  Master	
  is	
  available	
  as	
  an	
  online	
  course.	
  To	
  learn	
  how	
  
you	
   can	
   work	
   personally	
   with	
   the	
   Masters	
   to	
   achieve	
   your	
   own	
   mastery,	
   go	
  
to:	
  	
  www.WalkTheEarthAsALivingMaster.com	
  and	
   click	
   on	
   Mastery	
   I	
  from	
   the	
  
menu.	
  
	
  
The	
   Courses	
   at	
  www.WalkTheEarthAsALivingMaster.com	
  have	
   been	
   designed	
   by	
  
the	
   Ascended	
   Masters	
   to	
   assist	
   you	
   in	
   embodying	
   the	
   Presence	
   and	
   living	
   in	
  
freedom	
  and	
  abundance.	
  
	
  	
  
The	
   Courses	
   to	
  Walk	
  the	
   Earth	
   as	
   a	
   Living	
   Master	
  are	
   offered	
   by	
   the	
  Unveiled	
  
Mystery	
  School	
  of	
  Maui,	
   created	
  by	
   the	
  Ascended	
  Masters	
   to	
  assist	
  humanity	
   in	
  
living	
  their	
  mastery.	
  The	
  receivers	
  of	
  the	
  Masters’	
  transmissions,	
  facilitators	
  of	
  the	
  
Courses	
   and	
   coordinators	
   of	
   the	
   school	
   are	
   Kamala	
   Everett	
   and	
   Sharon	
   Rose.	
  
Kamala	
  is	
  the	
  author	
  of	
  “Heart	
  Initiation:	
  Preparing	
  for	
  Conscious	
  Ascension”	
  and	
  
has	
  been	
  receiving	
  transmissions	
  from	
  the	
  Masters	
  for	
  over	
  35	
  years.	
  Sharon	
  has	
  
been	
  in	
  communication	
  with	
  the	
  Masters	
  for	
  over	
  30	
  years,	
  past	
  Director	
  of	
  The	
  
School	
  for	
  Self-­‐Mastery	
  and	
  Center	
  for	
  Esoteric	
  Studies	
  and	
  has	
  written	
  more	
  than	
  
a	
  dozen	
  spiritual	
  books.	
  

Copyright	
  ©	
  2011	
  Diamond	
  Light	
  Foundation.	
  Copy	
  freely	
  and	
  share.	
  However,	
  we	
  
ask	
  that	
  you	
  share	
  this	
  newsletter	
  in	
  its	
  entirety,	
  including	
  the	
  copyright.	
  

To	
  subscribe,	
  click	
  on	
  info@WalkTheEarthAsALivingMaster.com	
  and	
  put	
  
“Subscribe”	
  in	
  the	
  subject	
  line.	
  We	
  respect	
  your	
  privacy	
  and	
  will	
  never	
  share	
  your	
  
email	
  address	
  with	
  others	
  



If	
   you	
   no	
   longer	
   wish	
   to	
   receive	
   this	
   newsletter,	
   send	
   an	
   email	
  
to	
  info@walktheearthasalivingmaster.com	
  and	
  put	
  “unsubscribe”	
  in	
  the	
  subject.	
  


